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The Goods and Services Tax (GST) framework in India has undergone several changes since
its inception in 2017. One of the most significant updates is the introduction of the Invoice
Management System (IMS) by the Goods and Services Tax Network (GSTN), slated to
launch on October 1, 2024. This new system aims to enhance the accuracy and
transparency of invoices, making it easier for businesses to claim Input Tax Credit (ITC)
while improving overall compliance with GST regulations.

Although the IMS promises to streamline the invoicing process, it also raises several
concerns regarding administrative burden, legal validity, and operational complexity. This
article delves into the functionalities of the new IMS, the challenges it presents to
businesses, and the steps they need to take to prepare for this significant shift.

Overview of the New GST Invoice Management System (IMS)

The IMS aims to address several issues that have plagued businesses under the current
GST regime, particularly concerning the management of GSTR-2B and GSTR-3B filings.
GSTR-2B is a static return that provides a detailed statement of ITC, which businesses can
claim based on invoices uploaded by their suppliers. Meanwhile, GSTR-3B is a summary
return used to declare the tax liabilities of a business for a particular period.

Under the new IMS, recipients will be able to preview invoices uploaded by suppliers before
they are included in GSTR-2B and auto-populated into GSTR-3B. This preview function
allows businesses to detect errors or discrepancies in invoices, providing an additional layer
of control over the ITC claims process.

However, while this additional control over invoices is a positive development, the
complexity and potential administrative burden associated with the IMS could pose
significant challenges for businesses.

Challenges Related to IMS

Despite the benefits IMS offers, several challenges and gaps need to be addressed to
ensure its successful implementation. These challenges include:

1. Legal Validity of IMS

One of the most significant concerns surrounding the new system is its legal foundation.
The IMS introduces processes similar to those proposed in the now-abandoned GSTR-2 and
GSTR-3 forms, which were scrapped due to their complexity. Many businesses are
questioning whether the IMS has sufficient legal backing, especially since it revives aspects
of a previously defunct system. This raises the risk of future legal disputes, as businesses
may challenge the system's validity.
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2. Deemed Acceptance and Its Consequences

The deemed acceptance provision introduces the risk of businesses inadvertently accepting
incorrect invoices. If a business fails to review an invoice within the specified timeframe, it
may passively accept discrepancies, which could lead to incorrect ITC claims and potential
disputes with suppliers. This could become a significant issue for businesses with high
transaction volumes, as the manual effort required to review each invoice may be
considerable.

3. Increase in confusion for recipient 

One of the more complex aspects of the IMS is the requirement for recipients to reassess
invoices when suppliers modify them. If a recipient has already acted on an invoice and the
supplier subsequently makes changes, the recipient's original action is nullified, and they
must re-evaluate the invoice. This could create confusion and add to the compliance
burden, as businesses need to constantly monitor and track supplier modifications.

4. Tracking Pending Invoices

Another major concern is the need to track pending invoices in IMS separately from
accounting systems like SAP or Tally. This creates a duplication of effort and increases the
complexity of the compliance process. Businesses will need to ensure that their ERP
systems are aligned with the new IMS functionalities to avoid reconciliation challenges.

5. Supplier Liability Due to Recipient Actions

Another concern is the potential increase in supplier tax liability due to recipient actions.
For example, if a recipient rejects a credit note, the supplier may face an increased tax
burden in the next filing period. This could lead to disputes between suppliers and
recipients, further complicating business relationships and adding to compliance
challenges.

6. Need for new softwares

As the new Invoice Management System (IMS) rolls out, businesses will likely face the need
for updated software to meet the system’s demands. This requirement stems from the
various new functionalities and compliance requirements introduced by IMS, which existing
accounting and ERP systems may not fully support.

7. Data Integration and Migration

Migrating large volumes of historical data from the current system to the new IMS is
complex. Ensuring accurate data transfer without loss or corruption is essential.
Implementing clear protocols and thorough testing during data migration to prevent
mismatches and potential issues.

8. System Scalability

Since GSTN processes millions of transactions daily, the new IMS must scale effectively to
manage increasing data volumes and user load, particularly during peak times such as
filing deadlines. Developing a robust infrastructure that supports elastic scaling and
enhances server capacity during high-traffic periods.

9. Train Staff and Update Processes

Businesses must invest in training their staff to handle the new complexities introduced by
IMS. This includes teaching employees how to review invoices, track pending invoices, and
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manage invoice modifications efficiently. Businesses should also update their internal
processes to accommodate the new system.

10. Collaborate Closely with Suppliers

To minimize disputes and ensure smooth compliance, businesses must work closely with
their suppliers. Clear communication about invoice modifications and rejections will be
crucial to avoiding compliance issues and maintaining strong supplier relationships.

11. Impact on ITC Reversal and Reclaims:

A significant implication of IMS is in the reversal and reclaiming of ITC. If an invoice remains
pending for too long, businesses might need to reverse the ITC, and the process to reclaim
it (if accepted later) could become more intricate. Detailed monitoring will be essential to
avoid unintentional ITC reversals or overstated claims.

12. Handling of Specific Invoice Categories:

Some invoices, particularly those dealing with imports and ISD (Input Service
Distributors), may not flow seamlessly into IMS. Companies handling these categories need
to check whether these invoices are captured appropriately or if they continue to be
managed outside of IMS.

13. E-Way Bill and E-Invoicing Integration

GST compliance requires the generation of e-way bills for the transportation of goods and e-
invoicing for certain transactions. To ensure real-time compliance, it is crucial that the IMS
integrates smoothly with these systems.

Failure to achieve seamless integration with e-way bill and e-invoicing systems can result in
logistical delays, potential penalties, or the rejection of invoices.

14. Complexity of Managing Amendments

The system allows suppliers to amend invoices, and these changes automatically reflect in
the recipient’s dashboard. If the recipient has already acted on the original invoice, the
amended one can replace the previous data, potentially causing confusion. Managing
invoice amendments and ensuring that both parties (supplier and recipient) are aligned on
the changes may be challenging. Incorrect handling of amendments could lead to
mismatches and compliance issues.

Conclusion: Navigating the New IMS Environment

The introduction of the IMS marks a significant shift in the GST compliance landscape,
offering businesses more control over their invoices and ITC claims. However, the system
also introduces new complexities that businesses must carefully manage to avoid
compliance issues, disputes, and delays in filing.

While the IMS offers the potential for more streamlined ITC claims, its success will largely
depend on how well businesses adapt to its intricacies. As the system rolls out in October
2024, businesses must assess their internal processes, train staff, and collaborate with
suppliers to ensure a smooth transition to this new regime.

Navigating the new IMS environment will require diligence, attention to detail, and a strong
understanding of the GST framework. With the right preparations, businesses can turn the
IMS from a compliance burden into an opportunity for improved tax management and
operational efficiency.
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